
SPECIAL TOWN MEETING 

TOWN OF MONTAGUE 


COMMONWEALTH OF MASSACHlISETTS 

March 2, 2017 


Franklin, ss. 

To either of the Constables of the Town of Montague in the County of Franklin: 

GREETING: 

In the name of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts, you are hereby directed to notify and warn 
the Inhabitants of the Town of Montague qualified to vote in Town affairs to meet in the Turners Falls 
High School Theater on Thursday, March 2, 2017, at 7:00 P.M. and to act on the following articles and 
any motions which may be presented. 

ARTICLE 1. To see if the Town will vote to receive and act upon the report of the Public Works 
Facility Planning Committee. 

ARTICLE 2. To see ifthe Town will vote to amend the classification plan adding the position of WPCF 
Chief Operator at Grade F as per the Memorandum of Agreement between the Town of Montague and the 
Town of Montague Employees Association dated January 9, 2017, or to pass any vote or votes in relation 
thereto. 

ARTICLE 3. To see if the Town will vote to amend the classification plan changing the title of WPCF 
Senior ClerklLab Technician to Administrative AssistantlLab Technician at Grade D as per the 
Memorandum of Agreement between the Town of Montague and the Town of Montague Employees 
Association dated January 9, 2017, or to pass any vote or votes in relation thereto. 

ARTICLE 4. To see if the Town will vote to amend the classification plan to modify the duties of the 
WPCF Operator/Laborer at Grade B as per the Memorandum of Agreement between the Town of 
Montague and the United Electrical, Radio and Machine Workers of America, Local 274 dated December 
20, 2016, or to pass any vote or votes in relation thereto. 

ARTICLE 5. To see if the Town will vote to amend the classification plan to change the title of WPCF 
Operator to Wastewater Technician at Grade D as per the Memorandum of Agreement betvveen the Town 
of Montague and the United Electrical, Radio and Machine Workers of America, Local 274 dated 
December 20,2016, or to pass any vote or votes in relation thereto. 

ARTICLE 6. To see if the Town will vote to amend the classification plan to add the position ofWPCF 
Lead Mechanic at Grade E as per the Memorandum of Agreement between the Town of Montague and 
the United Electrical, Radio and Machine Workers of America, Local 274 dated December 20,2016, or to 
pass any vote or votes in relation thereto. 

ARTICLE 7. To see if the Town will vote to amend the classification plan to add the position ofWPCF 
Lead Operator at Grade E as per the Memorandum of Agreement between the Town of Montague and the 
United Electrical, Radio and Machine Workers of America, Local 274 dated December 20,20 I6, or to 
pass any vote or votes in relation thereto. 
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ARTICLE 8. To see if the town will vote to accept the last paragraph ofMGL Chapter 41, Section 111 F, 
which allows the town to establish a special injury leave indemnity fund for payment of injury leave 
compensation or medical bills incurred by a police officer during the performance of his/her duties, 
appropriate monies into the fund or deposit funds received from insurance proceeds or restitution, and to 
pay expenses incurred under Section 111F without appropriation with the approval of the Board of 
Selectmen, or to pass any vote or votes in relation thereto. 

ARTICLE 9. To see if the town will vote to raise and appropriate, transfer from available funds, borrow, 
or otherwise provide the sum of $3,000 or any other amount for the purpose of increasing the amount 
appropriated under Article 11 of the May 7, 2016 Annual Town Meeting, which appropriation was for the 
Town's share of the Airport Improvement Project 3-25-0032-19 or pass any vote or votes in relation 
thereto. 

ARTICLE 10. To see if the Town will vote to raise and appropriate, transfer from available funds, 
borrow, or otherwise provide any sum or sums of money for the purpose of stabilizing the Strathmore 
Paper Mill Buildings, including but not 1 imited to the expenditure of funds for roof and sprinkler repair, 
debris removal, securing the buildings and any other related costs or to pass any vote or votes in relation 
thereto. 
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en under our hands this 13th day of February in the Year of Our Lord Two Thousand and Seventeen. 

Michael Nelson 

Franklin, ss Montague, MA February IS, 2017 

Pursuant to the within warrant, I have warned the Inhabitants of the Town of Montague by posting 
attested copies of the same in a conspicuous place in each of the Post Offices, Libraries, and the Town 
Hall of the Town of Montague at least fourteen days before said meeting as within directed. 
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